
83 STAT. 1 PUBLIC LAW 91-185-DEC. 30, 1969 847 

EFFECTIVE DATE 

SEC. 13. (a) This Act takes effect upon the expiration of the Export 
Control Act of 1949. ^"'«' p- ^^>^-

(b) Al l outstanding delegations, rules, regulations, orders, licenses, 
or other forms of admin i s t ra t ive action imder the Export Control Ac t 
of 1949 or section 6 of the Ac t of Julv 2, 1940 ^54 Stat. 714) , shall, ^of J^ff ^'"'' 
until amended or revoked, remain in full force and effect, the same as if 
promulgated under this Act. 

TERMINATION DATE 

SEC. 14. The authority granted by this Act terminates on June 30, 
1971, or upon any prior date which the Congress by concurrent resolu­
tion or the President by proclamation may designate. 

Approved December 30, 1969. 

P u b l i c Law 91-185 
AN ACT ^ , ,„ , _ „ 

December 30,, 1969 
To amend the Central Intelligence Agency Retirement Act of 1964 for Certain [H. R. 14571] 

Employees, as amended, and for other purposes. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled^ T h a t — gence*Aien"*y ^"' 

SECTION 1. Section 211(a) of t he Cent ra l Intel l igence Agency Retirement Act of 
Ee t i r emen t Act of 1964 for Cer ta in Employees , as amended (78 Sta t . ^^^^^1°^^^^"^^''' 
1043; 50 U.S .C. 403 no te ) , is fur ther amended by s t r ik ing out "S ix amendment! 
and one-half per cen tum" in the first sentence and inser t ing "Seven 
per centum". 

S E C . 2. Section 221 of the Cent ra l Intellisrence Agencv Ret i rement Average pay 
. ^ ^ _ ^ . - , - , to to u computation. 

Act (50 U.S.C. 403 note) is a m e n d e d : 78 stat. 1045. 
(a) by striking out in paragraph (a) "five consecutive years 

of service," and inserting "three consecutive years of service (or, 
in the case of an annuity computed under section 232 and based 
on less than three years, over the total service),"; 

(b) by striking out from the first sentence of paragraph (b) 
"or remarriage of such surviving wife or husband" and inserting 
"or upon remarriage prior to attaining age sixty of such surviving 
wife or husband"; 

(c) by striking out in paragraph (c) the items "40 per centum", 
"$600", "$L800'\ "50 per centum", "$720", and "$2,160", and 
inserting "60 per centum", "$900", "$2,700", "75 per centum", 
"$1,080'^ and "$3,240"; 

(d) by adding new paragraph (g) : 
" (g) In the case of remarriage on or after age sixty an annuity shall pr<^l^o"s!^^ 

be payable if remarriage has occurred on or after July 18, 1966, and 



848 PUBLIC LAW 91-185-DEC. 30, 1969 [83 STAT. 

if the surviving wife or husband, immediately before such remarriage, 
was receiving an annuity from the Central Intelligence Agency Retire­
ment and Disability Fund. The annuity of a surviving spouse termi­
nated as a result oi remarriage which occurred prior to age sixty and 
on or after July 18, 1966, shall be restored at the same rate commenc­
ing on the day the remarriage is dissolved by death, annulment, or 
divorce, if— 

"(1) the surviving spouse elects to receive this annuity instead 
of a survivor benefit to which he may be entitled, under this or 
another retirement system for Government employees, by reason 
of the remarriage; and 

"(2) any lump sum paid on termination of the annuity is 
returned to the fund. 

No annuity shall be paid by reason of this paragraph for any period 
prior to October 20, 1969. No annuity shall be terminated solely by 
reason of the enactment of this paragraph."; and 

(e) by adding new paragraph (h) : 
Unused sick ^^ (h) In computing an annuity under this section the service credit 

l e a v e c r e d i t i » » " t » i • • •%• 

50 use 403 of a participant who retires, except under section 231, on an immediate 
"°te' annuity or dies leaving a survivor or survivors entitled to annuity 

includes, without regard to the limitations imposed by paragraph (a) , 
the days of unused sick leave to his credit under a formal leave system, 
except that these days will not be counted in determining average basic 
salary or annuity eligibility. The contribution specified in section 252 
shall not be required for days of unused sick leave credited under this 
paragraph.". 

SEC. 3. Section 231(a) of the Central Intelligence Agency Eetire-
ment Act (50 U.S.C. 403 note) is amended by striking ", but this 
provision shall not increase the annuity of any survivor" from the last 
sentence. 

SEC. 4. (a) Section 232(b) of the Central Intelligence Agency 
Retirement Act (50 U.S.C. 403 note) is amended: 

(1) by striking "five years" and inserting "eighteen months" 
(2) by inserting, after "221(a)", ", except that the computa­

tion of the annuity of the participant under such section shall be 
at least the smaller of (i) 40 per centum of the participant's 
average basic salary, or (ii) the sum obtained under such section 
after increasing the participant's service of the type last per­
formed by the difference between his age at the time of death and 
age sixty"; and 

(3) by striking "remarriage of the widow or dependent 
widower" and inserting "upon remarriage prior to attaining age 
sixty of the widow or dependent widower (subject to the payment 
and restoration provisions of section 221 (g ) ) " . 

(b) Sections 232 (c) and (d) are amended by striking "five years" 
and inserting "eighteen months". 

78 Stat. 1046. 



83 STAT. ] PUBLIC LAW 91-186-DEC. 30, 1969 849 

SEC. 5. Section 291 of the Central Intelligence Agency Retirement cost-of-uving 
Act (50 U.S.C. 403 note) is amended: ""̂ srst̂ t̂r'goa. 

(a) by inserting "1 per centum plus*' immediately after the 
word "by" in paragraph (a) (2) ; and 

(b) by amending paragraphs (b) (2) and (b) (3) to read: 
"(2) For the purpose of computing the annuity of a child under 

section 221(c) that commences after October 31, 1969, the items $900, ŝ stat. io45. 
$1,080, $2,700, and $3,240 appearing in section 221 (c) shall be increased 
by the total per centum increases allowed and in force under this sec­
tion on or after such day, and, in case of a deceased annuitant, the 
items 60 per centum and 75 per centum appearing in section 221 (c) 
shall be increased by the total per centum allowed and in force to 
the annuitant under this section on or after such day. 

"(3) The annuity of each surviving child receiving an annuity 
imder section 221 immediately prior to November 1, 1969, shall be 
recomputed effective November 1, 1969, in accordance with paragraph 
(b ) (2 ) . No increase allowed and in force prior to such date under sec­
tion 291 shall be included in the recomputation of any such annuity, 
and this paragraph shall not operate to reduce any annuity.". 

SEC. 6. (a) The amendments made by section 1 shall become effec- Effective dates. 
tive at the beginning of the first applicable pay period beginning after 
December 31, 1969. 

(b) The amendments made by sections 3, 4, and 2, with the excep­
tion of 2 (c) , shall become effective October 20,1969. 

(c) The amendments made by sections 2(c) and 5 shall become 
effective November 1, 1969. 

(d) The amendments made by sections 2 (a ) , 2(e) , 3, and 4(a) ( 1 ) -
(2) shall not apply in the cases of persons retired or otherwise sepa­
rated prior to October 20j 1969, and the rights of such persons and 
their survivors shall continue in the same manner and to the same 
extent as if such sections had not been enacted. 

Approved December 30, 1969. 

Public Law 91-186 

JOINT RESOLUTION 
December 30, 1969 

To authorize appropriations for expenses of the OflBce of Intergovernmental [s.j. Res. 117] 
Relations, and for other purposes. 

Certain perisons, 
except ion. 

Office of Inter­
governmental 

Resolved hy the Senate and House of Representatives of the United 
States of Ameriea in Congress assembled^ That there is hereby author­
ized to be appropriated such sums as may be necessary for expenses of Relations. 
the Office of Intergovernmental Relations (referred to hereafter as the authorTL'L'tion'" 
''Office"), established by Executive Order Numbered 11455 of Febru­
ary 14, 1969. 3̂̂ CFR 1969 

SEC. 2. The Director of the Office shall be compensated at a rate of "^""P" ^' ^ 
basic compensation not to exceed the rate now or hereafter provided for 
level IV of the Federal Executive Salary Schedule. ^ost, p. 864. 

SEC. 3. The Director of the Office is authorized— 
(1) to appoint such personnel as he deems necessary, without 

regard to the provisions of title 5, United States Code, governing 
appointments in the competitive services; and 

(2) to obtain the services of experts and consultants in accord­
ance with section 3109 of title 5, United States Code, at rates not so stat. 4i6. 
to exceed the daily equivalent of the rate now or hereafter pro­
vided for GS-18. 5 use 5332 

note . 

Approved December 30, 1969. 


		Superintendent of Documents
	2012-10-10T10:33:23-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




